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Dear ,

Thank you for your freedom of information request of 14 August 2024. We are responding
to you under the Freedom of Information (Scotland) Act 2002.

FOI REQUEST (14 August 2024)

1. Please provide figures showing how many employees in each of the last three years
that Disclosure Scotland has been informed have been convicted of offences.
Please break the figures down to show the nature of offences involved?

2. The number of employees in Scotland that currently have criminal records, please
provide a brief description of what they have been convicted of in the past, i.e.
assault, driving offences, theft etc?

3. The number of employees in Scotland who hold a PVG and have a criminal
conviction. Please provide a breakdown by role and their convictions, i.e. driving
offences, theft etc?

FOI RESPONSE

1. South of Scotland Enterprise (SOSE) does not hold information about what is
provided to Disclosure Scotland. Therefore, we apply Section 17 of the Freedom of
Information Scotland Act 2002 and confirm that SOSE does not hold the information
requested.

2. Under Section 17 of the Freedom of Information Scotland Act 2002 we confirm that
SOSE does not hold the information requested.

3. Under Section 17 of the Freedom of Information Scotland Act 2002 we confirm that
SOSE does not hold the information requested.

You have the right to request a review of the way in which this request has been
processed. Should you wish to exercise this right, you will need to contact us within 40
working days of receipt of this email.

If you remain dissatisfied on completion of the review, you have the right to appeal to the
Office of the Scottish Information Commissioner (SIC) and thereafter to the Court of
Session on a point of law only.

Scottish Information Commissioner
Kinburn Castle
Doubledykes Road
St Andrews

240827 (138) FOI Criminal Records



Fife
KY16 9DS
Telephone: 01334 464610
www.foi.scot  
or for online appeals:
www.foi.scot/appeal
  
Regards,
SOSE Corporate Relations
FOI@sose.scot
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